
Y u m a  C o u n t y  D e p a r t m e n t  o f  
D e v e l o p m e n t  S e r v i c e s  

2012 International Existing Building Code 
(IEBC) Amendments 

Chapter 1 Scope and Administration 

101.1 Title.  Amend to read, “These regulations shall be known as the Existing Building Code of 
City of Yuma, herein after referred to as ‘this code.’” 

Section 103.1 Creation of enforcement agency.  Amend to read; “The Department of 
Community Development, Building Safety Division is hereby created and the official in 
charge thereof shall be known as the building official.” 

Create Section 103.1.1. Amend all sections of this code that reference the “code official” by re-
placing to read the “building official”. 

Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit.  Add new item #7, under “Building:” 

7. “Window replacements of like size where framing is not altered and any required 
emergency egress dimensions are not diminished from existing, in Group R-3 one-and 
two-family dwellings and installed by either a licensed contractor or owner-occupant of 
the residence.” 

Section 105.3.2 Time limitation of application.  Amend first sentence to read; “An applica-
tion for a permit for any proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after 
the date of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit has been is-
sued; except that the building official is authorized to grant one or more extensions of time for ad-
ditional periods not exceeding 180 days each.” 

Section 106.2.2 Fire protection system(s) shop drawings.  Amend to read; “Plan submit-
tal documents shall include either a statement of the design criteria for the fire protection system
(s) or the complete design, plans, calculations and data for the fire protection system(s).  If only 
the design criteria is initially submitted, the complete design, plans, calculations and data for the 
fire protection system(s) shall be submitted to indicate conformance to this code and the construc-
tion documents and shall be approved prior to the start of system installation.  In addition, where 
applicable, shop drawings, calculations and data shall be submitted and shall contain all informa-
tion as required by the referenced installation standards in Chapter 9 of the International Build-
ing Code.”                 

 

 Cont... 

2351 W. 26th Street,  Yuma, AZ  85364 

1 



Add new section, “108.2.1 Plan review fees.  When submittal documents are required by 
Section [A] 106.1, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting the submittal docu-
ments for plan review. Said plan review fee shall be 65 percent of the building permit fee as shown 
in Table 1-A. 

The plan review fees specified in this section are separate fees from the permit fees specified in 
Section [A] 108.2 and are in addition to the permit fees. 

When submittal documents are incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan review, an 
additional plan review fee shall be charged at the rate shown in Table 1-A.” 

Section 108.6 Refunds.  Amend to read, “The building official shall authorize the refunding of 
fees as follows: 

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected. 

2. Not more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a 
permit issued in accordance with this code. 

3. Not more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit 
for which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan re-
view effort has been expended.” 

The building official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid except upon written applica-
tion filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the date of fee payment.” 

Add the following to Section 108.4 Work commencing before permit issuance.  “An 
investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit is then or 
subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall be determined by the building official, based on 
the circumstances, nature, and severity of the infraction. The minimum investigation fee shall be 
$50.00 and the maximum shall be an amount up to the same as the fee set forth in Table 1-A.” 

Section 109.3.5 Lath and gypsum board inspection.  Delete exception to this section. 

Section 109.6 Approval required.  Add to end of section; “Inspection comments shall include 
code section references, when requested.” 

 

Cont... 

IEBC Amendments continued... 

Y u m a  C o u n t y  D e p a r t m e n t  o f  D e v e l o p m e n t  S e r v i c e s  

2 



Add the following to Section 112.1 General.  “The membership of the Residential Advisory 
Board, as prescribed in Section 150-175 of the Yuma City Code, will be the Board of Appeals for 
Residential appeals (one-and two-family dwellings).  The membership of the Building Advisory 
Board, as prescribed in Section 150-016 of the Yuma City Code, will be the Board of Appeals for 
Commercial appeals.” 

Delete Section 112.3 Qualifications. 

Section 113.4 Violation penalties.  Amend to read; “Any person who violates a provision of 
this code or fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who repairs or alters or 
changes the occupancy of a building or structure in violation of the approved construction docu-
ments or directive of the building official or of a permit or certificate issued under the provision of 
this code, shall be subject to the penalty and fine described in Section __ of this ordi-
nance.” 

Section 114.3 Unlawful continuance. Amend to read; “Any person who shall continue any 
work after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed 
to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to the penalty and fine 
described in Section __ of this ordinance.” 

Chapter 4 Prescriptive Compliance Method 

Delete Section 403.2 Flood hazard areas, in favor of adopted city floodplain ordinances. 

Delete Section 404.5 Flood hazard areas, in favor of adopted city floodplain ordinances. 

Delete Section 410 Accessibility for existing buildings, in its entirety. 

Accessibility provisions for maintenance, change of occupancy, additions and alterations to exist-
ing buildings and facilities, including those identified as historic buildings, shall be in accordance 
with Arizona Revised Statutes, Title 41, Chapter 9, Article 8, Public Accommodations and Services, 
The Arizonans with Disabilities Act, R10-3-401 through R10-3-404, which includes – 28 CFR 35 
and 28 CFR 36 and Americans with Disabilities Act Accessibility Guidelines for Buildings and Fa-
cilities (ADAAG). 

Chapter 6 Repairs 

Delete Section 606.2.4 Flood hazard areas, in favor of city adopted floodplain ordinances. 

Cont... 

IEBC Amendments continued... 

Y u m a  C o u n t y  D e p a r t m e n t  o f  D e v e l o p m e n t  S e r v i c e s  

3 



Chapter 7 Alterations—Level 1 

Delete Section 705 Accessibility, in its entirety. 

A facility that is altered shall be in accordance with Arizona Revised Statutes, Title 41, Chapter 9, 
Article 8, Public Accommodations and Services, The Arizonans with Disabilities Act, R10-3-401 
through R10-3-404, which includes – 28 CFR 35 and 28 CFR 36 and Americans with Disabilities 
Act Accessibility Guidelines for Buildings and Facilities (ADAAG). 

Section  706.3.2 Roof diaphragms resisting wind loads in high-wind regions.  Amend 
first sentence to read; “Where roofing materials are removed from more than 50% of the roof dia-
phragm or section of a building located where the basic wind speed is greater than 115 mph (per 
IBC Figure 1609A) or in a special wind region, as defined in Section 1609 of the International 
Building Code, roof diaphragms, connections of the roof diaphragms to roof framing members, 
and roof-to-wall connections shall be evaluated for the wind loads specified in the International 
Building Code, including wind uplift.”  

Chapter 8 Alterations—Level 2 

Section 801.1 Scope.  Amend exception to section as follows: 

“Exception:  Buildings in which the reconfiguration is exclusively the result of 
accessibility improvements shall be permitted to comply with Chapter 7.” 

Section 805.4.4 Panic Hardware.  Amend to read; “In any work area, and in the egress path 
from any work area to the exit discharge, in buildings or portions thereof of Group A assembly 
occupancies and Group E educational occupancies with an occupant load greater than 50, 
all required exit doors shall be equipped with approved panic hardware.” 

Delete Section 806 Accessibility, in its entirety. 

A building, facility, or element that is altered shall be in accordance with Arizona Revised Stat-
utes, Title 41, Chapter 9, Article 8, Public Accommodations and Services, The Arizonans with Dis-
abilities Act, R10-3-401 through R10-3-404, which includes – 28 CFR 35 and 28 CFR 36 and 
Americans with Disabilities Act Accessibility Guidelines for Buildings and Facilities (ADAAG). 

 

 

Cont... 

IEBC Amendments continued... 

Y u m a  C o u n t y  D e p a r t m e n t  o f  D e v e l o p m e n t  S e r v i c e s  

4 



Chapter 9 Alterations—Level 3 
Section 901.1 Scope.  Amend exception to section as follows: 

“Exception:  Buildings in which the reconfiguration of space affecting exits or 
shared egress access is exclusively the result of accessibility improvements shall 
not be required to comply with this chapter.” 

Delete Section 906 Accessibility, in its entirety. 

A building, facility, or element that is altered shall be in accordance with Arizona Revised Stat-
utes, Title 41, Chapter 9, Article 8, Public Accommodations and Services, The Arizonans with Dis-
abilities Act, R10-3-401 through R10-3-404, which includes – 28 CFR 35 and 28 CFR 36 and 
Americans with Disabilities Act Accessibility Guidelines for Buildings and Facilities (ADAAG). 

Chapter 10 Change of Occupancy 
Delete Section 1012.8 Accessibility, in its entirety. 

Existing buildings that undergo a change of group or occupancy classification shall be in accor-
dance with Arizona Revised Statutes, Title 41, Chapter 9, Article 8, Public Accommodations and 
Services, The Arizonans with Disabilities Act, R10-3-401 through R10-3-404, which includes – 28 
CFR 35 and 28 CFR 36 and Americans with Disabilities Act Accessibility Guidelines for Buildings 
and Facilities (ADAAG). 

Chapter 11 Additions 
Delete Section 1103.5 Flood hazard areas, in favor of city adopted floodplain ordinances. 

Delete Section 1105 Accessibility, in its entirety. 

Accessibility provisions for new construction shall apply for additions, and shall be in accordance 
with Arizona Revised Statutes, Title 41, Chapter 9, Article 8, Public Accommodations and Services, 
The Arizonans with Disabilities Act, R10-3-401 through R10-3-404, which includes – 28 CFR 35 
and 28 CFR 36 and Americans with Disabilities Act Accessibility Guidelines for Buildings and Fa-
cilities (ADAAG).  

Chapter 12 Historic Buildings 
Delete Section 1201.4 Flood hazard areas, in favor of city adopted floodplain ordinances. 

Cont... 

IEBC Amendments continued... 

Y u m a  C o u n t y  D e p a r t m e n t  o f  D e v e l o p m e n t  S e r v i c e s  

5 



Chapter 12 Historic Buildings (cont…) 

Delete Section 1204.1 Accessibility Requirements in its entirety. 

Accessibility provisions for historic buildings that undergo alterations, shall be in accordance 
with Arizona Revised Statutes, Title 41, Chapter 9, Article 8, Public Accommodations and Services, 
The Arizonans with Disabilities Act, R10-3-401 through R10-3-404, which includes – 28 CFR 35 
and 28 CFR 36 and Americans with Disabilities Act Accessibility Guidelines for Buildings and Fa-
cilities (ADAAG). 

Delete Section 1205.15 Accessibility requirements in its entirety. 

Accessibility provisions for historic buildings that undergo a change of occupancy,  shall be in ac-
cordance with Arizona Revised Statutes, Title 41, Chapter 9, Article 8, Public Accommodations 
and Services, The Arizonans with Disabilities Act, R10-3-401 through R10-3-404, which includes 
– 28 CFR 35 and 28 CFR 36 and Americans with Disabilities Act Accessibility Guidelines for 
Buildings and Facilities (ADAAG). 

Delete Section 1401.2.5 Accessibility requirements in its entirety. 

Accessibility provisions for buildings or portions of buildings proposed for change of occupancy, 
shall be in accordance with Arizona Revised Statutes, Title 41, Chapter 9, Article 8, Public Accom-
modations and Services, The Arizonans with Disabilities Act, R10-3-401 through R10-3-404, 
which includes – 28 CFR 35 and 28 CFR 36 and Americans with Disabilities Act Accessibility 
Guidelines for Buildings and Facilities (ADAAG). 

Delete Section 1401.3.3 Compliance with flood hazard provisions, in favor of city 
adopted floodplain ordinances. 

Appendices 

APPENDIX A GUIDELINES FOR THE SEISMIC RETROFIT OF EXISTING BUILD-
INGS.  Appendix A is adopted. 

APPENDIX B SUPPLEMENTARY ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMENTS FOR EXISTING 
BUILDINGS AND FACILITIES.  Appendix B is not adopted. 

APPENDIX C GUIDELINES FOR THE WIND RETROFIT OF EXISTING BUILDINGS.  
Appendix C is not adopted. 

IEBC Amendments continued... 

Y u m a  C o u n t y  D e p a r t m e n t  o f  D e v e l o p m e n t  S e r v i c e s  

6 

For additional information or for specific regulations and permitting requirements, visit the Building Safety or Customer 

Service division located at 2351 W 26th St., Yuma, AZ  85364 or call (928) 817‐5000. 


	Yuma County Department of Development Services

	2012 International Existing Building Code (IEBC) Amendments

	IEBC Amendments continued...

	Yuma County Department of Development Services

	IEBC Amendments continued...

	Yuma County Department of Development Services

	IEBC Amendments continued...

	Yuma County Department of Development Services

	IEBC Amendments continued...

	Yuma County Department of Development Services

	IEBC Amendments continued...

	Yuma County Department of Development Services



<<

  /ASCII85EncodePages false

  /AllowTransparency false

  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true

  /AutoRotatePages /None

  /Binding /Left

  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)

  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)

  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)

  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)

  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error

  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4

  /CompressObjects /Tags

  /CompressPages true

  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true

  /PassThroughJPEGImages true

  /CreateJobTicket false

  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default

  /DetectBlends true

  /DetectCurves 0.0000

  /ColorConversionStrategy /CMYK

  /DoThumbnails false

  /EmbedAllFonts true

  /EmbedOpenType false

  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true

  /EmbedJobOptions true

  /DSCReportingLevel 0

  /EmitDSCWarnings false

  /EndPage -1

  /ImageMemory 1048576

  /LockDistillerParams false

  /MaxSubsetPct 100

  /Optimize true

  /OPM 1

  /ParseDSCComments true

  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true

  /PreserveCopyPage true

  /PreserveDICMYKValues true

  /PreserveEPSInfo true

  /PreserveFlatness true

  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false

  /PreserveOPIComments true

  /PreserveOverprintSettings true

  /StartPage 1

  /SubsetFonts true

  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply

  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve

  /UsePrologue false

  /ColorSettingsFile ()

  /AlwaysEmbed [ true

  ]

  /NeverEmbed [ true

  ]

  /AntiAliasColorImages false

  /CropColorImages true

  /ColorImageMinResolution 300

  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK

  /DownsampleColorImages true

  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic

  /ColorImageResolution 300

  /ColorImageDepth -1

  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1

  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000

  /EncodeColorImages true

  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode

  /AutoFilterColorImages true

  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG

  /ColorACSImageDict <<

    /QFactor 0.15

    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]

  >>

  /ColorImageDict <<

    /QFactor 0.15

    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]

  >>

  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<

    /TileWidth 256

    /TileHeight 256

    /Quality 30

  >>

  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<

    /TileWidth 256

    /TileHeight 256

    /Quality 30

  >>

  /AntiAliasGrayImages false

  /CropGrayImages true

  /GrayImageMinResolution 300

  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK

  /DownsampleGrayImages true

  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic

  /GrayImageResolution 300

  /GrayImageDepth -1

  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2

  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000

  /EncodeGrayImages true

  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode

  /AutoFilterGrayImages true

  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG

  /GrayACSImageDict <<

    /QFactor 0.15

    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]

  >>

  /GrayImageDict <<

    /QFactor 0.15

    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]

  >>

  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<

    /TileWidth 256

    /TileHeight 256

    /Quality 30

  >>

  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<

    /TileWidth 256

    /TileHeight 256

    /Quality 30

  >>

  /AntiAliasMonoImages false

  /CropMonoImages true

  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200

  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK

  /DownsampleMonoImages true

  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic

  /MonoImageResolution 1200

  /MonoImageDepth -1

  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000

  /EncodeMonoImages true

  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode

  /MonoImageDict <<

    /K -1

  >>

  /AllowPSXObjects false

  /CheckCompliance [

    /None

  ]

  /PDFX1aCheck false

  /PDFX3Check false

  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false

  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true

  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [

    0.00000

    0.00000

    0.00000

    0.00000

  ]

  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true

  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [

    0.00000

    0.00000

    0.00000

    0.00000

  ]

  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()

  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()

  /PDFXOutputCondition ()

  /PDFXRegistryName ()

  /PDFXTrapped /False



  /CreateJDFFile false

  /Description <<



    /BGR <>

    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065876863900275284e8e9ad88d2891cf76845370524d53705237300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>

    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef69069752865bc9ad854c18cea76845370524d5370523786557406300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>

    /CZE <>

    /DAN <>

    /DEU <>

    /ESP <>

    /ETI <>

    /FRA <>

    /GRE <>



    /HRV (Za stvaranje Adobe PDF dokumenata najpogodnijih za visokokvalitetni ispis prije tiskanja koristite ove postavke.  Stvoreni PDF dokumenti mogu se otvoriti Acrobat i Adobe Reader 5.0 i kasnijim verzijama.)

    /HUN <>

    /ITA <>

    /JPN <FEFF9ad854c18cea306a30d730ea30d730ec30b951fa529b7528002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020658766f8306e4f5c6210306b4f7f75283057307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a30674f5c62103055308c305f0020005000440046002030d530a130a430eb306f3001004100630072006f0062006100740020304a30883073002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee5964d3067958b304f30533068304c3067304d307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a306b306f30d530a930f330c8306e57cb30818fbc307f304c5fc59808306730593002>

    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020ace0d488c9c80020c2dcd5d80020c778c1c4c5d00020ac00c7a50020c801d569d55c002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>

    /LTH <>

    /LVI <>

    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die zijn geoptimaliseerd voor prepress-afdrukken van hoge kwaliteit. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)

    /NOR <>

    /POL <>

    /PTB <>

    /RUM <>

    /RUS <>

    /SKY <>

    /SLV <>

    /SUO <>

    /SVE <>

    /TUR <>

    /UKR <>

    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents best suited for high-quality prepress printing.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)

  >>

  /Namespace [

    (Adobe)

    (Common)

    (1.0)

  ]

  /OtherNamespaces [

    <<

      /AsReaderSpreads false

      /CropImagesToFrames true

      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue

      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false

      /IncludeGuidesGrids false

      /IncludeNonPrinting false

      /IncludeSlug false

      /Namespace [

        (Adobe)

        (InDesign)

        (4.0)

      ]

      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false

      /OmitPlacedEPS false

      /OmitPlacedPDF false

      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy

    >>

    <<

      /AddBleedMarks false

      /AddColorBars false

      /AddCropMarks false

      /AddPageInfo false

      /AddRegMarks false

      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK

      /DestinationProfileName ()

      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK

      /Downsample16BitImages true

      /FlattenerPreset <<

        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution

      >>

      /FormElements false

      /GenerateStructure false

      /IncludeBookmarks false

      /IncludeHyperlinks false

      /IncludeInteractive false

      /IncludeLayers false

      /IncludeProfiles false

      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings

      /Namespace [

        (Adobe)

        (CreativeSuite)

        (2.0)

      ]

      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK

      /PreserveEditing true

      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged

      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile

      /UseDocumentBleed false

    >>

  ]

>> setdistillerparams

<<

  /HWResolution [2400 2400]

  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]

>> setpagedevice





